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AGENCY:  The Broker is acting as agent for the Seller only.  In the event of any dispute after the sale, Results 
Realty/Results Land Co auction/Realty’s record of final sale shall be conclusive.  All information and materials 
provided by Broker is subject to inspection by all appropriate parties and the Broker assumes no liability for its 
accuracy, errors, or omissions nor its agents, the Seller or its agents.  Prospective buyers should independently 
verify any information being materially relied upon in making a purchasing decision.   

Liquidate damages: If purchaser chooses not to close within the stated time herein and no written extension has 
been granted by the Seller, the Purchaser will forfeit all the deposit.  If such action occurs, Results Realty/Results 
Land Co hereby has the right to disperse the deposit as stated in the listing agreement and the purchaser, has no 
claims to such money or property being sold.  Liquidated damages are to cover cost of auction, cost incurred by 
seller, labor cost, and additional cost of auction as not defined in this agreement.  These liquidated damages do 
not restrict the seller from suing the purchaser for performance damages and/or any additional damages the 
seller suffers by the default of the purchaser. 

  

BUYERS DUTY TO INSPECT: All information published, announced, or contained herein was derived from sources 
believed to be correct; however, it is not guaranteed by the seller, the broker, or any other person or entity.  
Personal onsite inspection of all property by potential bidders is strongly recommended.  All sales are subject to 
the conditions and terms contained herein.  The failure of any bidder to inspect, or to fully informed as to the 
condition of the property, will not constitute grounds for any claim or demand for adjustment or withdrawal of 
bid, offer or deposit money after its opening tender.  This includes but is not limited to public information such 
as easements, restrictions, zoning, rights-of-way, or any other information that can be obtained as public record 
in the county courthouse or any municipal office concerning subject properties.  Any and all announcements 
made from the auction stand take precedence over all other verbal, printed, announced, and/or distributed 
information.  Please note that you are bidding to purchase the Property “As is, Where is” with no warranties 
given or implied by seller or sellers agent. 

Results Realty/Results Land Co is the agent of the seller and their fiduciary duties of loyalty and faithfulness are 
owed to their client (the Seller). 

 


